
ITEM # DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED 
QTY UOM BID PRICE EXTENDED 

PRICE BID PRICE EXTENDED 
PRICE BID PRICE EXTENDED 

PRICE

1 Right-of-Way Mowing 
Services 4816 Acres $24.00 $115,584.00 No Bid No Bid $23.45 $112,935.20

2 Hand Mowing Services 236 Miles $75.00 $17,700.00 No Bid No Bid $175.00 $41,300.00

Estimated Annual Total: $133,284.00 $154,235.20

ITEM # DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED 
QTY UOM BID PRICE EXTENDED 

PRICE BID PRICE EXTENDED 
PRICE BID PRICE EXTENDED 

PRICE

1 Right-of-Way Mowing 
Services 3768 Acres $24.00 $90,432.00 No Bid No Bid $23.45 $88,359.60

2 Hand Mowing Services 164 Miles $75.00 $12,300.00 No Bid No Bid $175.00 $28,700.00

Estimated Annual Total: $102,732.00 $117,059.60

ITEM # DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED 
QTY UOM BID PRICE EXTENDED 

PRICE BID PRICE EXTENDED 
PRICE BID PRICE EXTENDED 

PRICE

1 Right-of-Way Mowing 
Services 4212 Acres $24.00 $101,088.00 $20.00 $84,240.00 $23.45 $98,771.40

2 Hand Mowing Services 224 Miles 75.00$          $16,800.00 150.00$        $33,600.00 175.00$        $39,200.00

Estimated Annual Total: $117,888.00 $117,840.00 $137,971.40

Lutz Inspections, LLC

Parde Enterprises, LLC

Parde Enterprises, LLC

Parde Enterprises, LLCLOCATION: MOWING AREA 630                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                           Great Plains Clearing & 
Excavating

LOCATION: MOWING AREA 610                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                         Great Plains Clearing & 
Excavating

NEBRASKA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
DISTRICT 6 - Interstate 80 RIGHT OF WAY MOWING, RFP #R303-23

BID TABULATION
BID OPENING DATE:  March 16, 2023, 3:00 P.M. CT

LOCATION: MOWING AREA 620                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                           Great Plains Clearing & 
Excavating
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Lutz Inspections, LLC
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