
BID TABULATION

NEBRASKA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

RFP #R308-23 REST AREA LANDSCAPING MAINTENANCE SERVICES FOR DISTRICTS 4 AND 5

Line #
Annual Total

Monthly Bid 

Price
Annual Total

Monthly Bid 

Price
Annual Total

Monthly Bid 

Price
Annual Total

Monthly Bid 

Price
Annual Total

1
40,800.00$     3,800.00$   45,600.00$       2,850.00$   34,200.00$      2,489.15$    29,869.80$       2,800.00$    33,600.00$       

2

40,800.00$     3,800.00$   45,600.00$       2,850.00$   34,200.00$      2,489.15$    29,869.80$       2,800.00$    33,600.00$       

3
46,800.00$     4,300.00$   51,600.00$       3,250.00$   39,000.00$      7,861.00$    94,332.00$       3,500.00$    42,000.00$       

4

40,800.00$     3,800.00$   45,600.00$       2,250.00$   27,000.00$      1,355.34$    16,264.08$       2,500.00$    30,000.00$       

5

 $     3,400.00 40,800.00$     3,800.00$   45,600.00$       2,250.00$   27,000.00$      2,100.29$    25,203.48$       2,500.00$    30,000.00$       

6

 $     3,400.00 40,800.00$     3,800.00$   45,600.00$       2,250.00$   27,000.00$      2,100.29$    25,203.48$       2,500.00$    30,000.00$       

250,800.00$   279,600.00$     188,400.00$    220,742.64$     199,200.00$     

Line #
Annual Total

Monthly Bid 

Price
Annual Total

Monthly Bid 

Price
Annual Total

Monthly Bid 

Price
Annual Total

Monthly Bid 

Price
Annual Total

1

58,800.00$     5,300.00$   63,600.00$       
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6,000.00$    72,000.00$       

2

49,200.00$     5,000.00$   60,000.00$       
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6,000.00$    72,000.00$       

108,000.00$   123,600.00$     144,000.00$     

4,900.00$     

4,100.00$     

Grand Total: 

Facility

York Rest Area-

Eastbound

Grand Island Rest 

Area-Eastbound
Grand Island Rest 

Area-Westbound

York Rest Area-

Westbound

Grand Total: 

DISTRICT 5 REST AREAS

Facility

Sidney Rest Area-

Eastbound

Sidney Rest Area-

Westbound

Monthly Bid 

Price

Garrets Lawn ServiceCoast to Coast ContractingSouthwest Janitorial, LLC

Monthly Bid 

Price

 $     3,900.00 

 $     3,400.00 

3,400.00$     

 $     3,400.00 

Kearney Rest Area - 

Westbound

Bigg's Lawn and Sprinklers

Nantkes Properties

Nantkes Properties

BIDDERS

Southwest Janitorial, LLC Coast to Coast Contracting Garrets Lawn Service

Bigg's Lawn and SprinklersDISTRICT 4 REST AREAS

Kearney Rest Area - 

Eastbound
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