

BID TABULATION SHEET

Project: **NDOT Statewide Storage Buildings**
 Bid Opening Date: **October 31, 2019 3:00 p.m.**



Bidder	MIWay Enterprises LLC 1711 322nd Street Elmwood, Nebraska 68349	Caspers Construction Company 800 South 10th Beatrice, Nebraska 68310	Gingerich Structures LLC 1626 Washington Street Blair, Nebraska 68008	Fuller Consturction Co. Inc. 160 Chadron Avenue Chadron, Nebraska 69337	Meyers Construction Inc. 79849 Highway 2 Broken Bow, Nebraska 68822	Axxent Builders LLC 608 Meridian Avenue Cozad, Nebraska 69130	Bidder
Substantial Completion Date	May 1, 2020	May 1, 2020	May 1, 2020	May 1, 2020	May 1, 2020	May 1, 2020	Substantial Completion Date
Bid Bond	Cashiers Check	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Cashiers Check	Bid Bond
Irregularities	None	None	None	None	None	None	Irregularities
Bid Amount Location 1 - (Lincoln - Superior Street - 10109) 30x50	\$43,083.00	\$71,142.00	\$41,100.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Bid Amount Location 1 - (Lincoln - Superior Street - 10109) 30x50
Bid Amount Location 2 - (Falls City - 13905) 30x50	\$43,257.00	\$71,142.00	\$41,100.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Bid Amount Location 2 - (Falls City - 13905) 30x50
Bid Amount Location 3 - (Pawnee City - 12407) 30x50	\$43,303.00	\$71,142.00	\$41,100.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Bid Amount Location 3 - (Pawnee City - 12407) 30x50
Bid Amount Location 4 - (Palmyra - 10805) 30x50	\$43,099.00	\$71,142.00	\$41,100.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Bid Amount Location 4 - (Palmyra - 10805) 30x50
Bid Amount Location 5 - (Omaha - Mormon Bridge - 20306) 30x50	\$43,918.00	\$75,000.00	\$41,100.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Bid Amount Location 5 - (Omaha - Mormon Bridge - 20306) 30x50
Bid Amount Location 6 - (Fremont - 21106) 30x50	\$43,996.00	\$74,000.00	\$41,100.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Bid Amount Location 6 - (Fremont - 21106) 30x50
Bid Amount Location 7 - (Plattsmouth - 21408) 30x50	\$43,996.00	\$73,000.00	\$41,100.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Bid Amount Location 7 - (Plattsmouth - 21408) 30x50
Bid Amount Location 8 - (Wayne - 33707) 30x50	\$42,845.00	\$83,400.00	\$41,600.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Bid Amount Location 8 - (Wayne - 33707) 30x50
Bid Amount Location 9 - (Humphrey - 34505) 30x50	\$42,918.00	\$77,400.00	\$41,600.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Bid Amount Location 9 - (Humphrey - 34505) 30x50
Bid Amount Location 10 - (Lyons - 33907) 30x50	\$42,717.00	\$77,400.00	\$41,600.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Bid Amount Location 10 - (Lyons - 33907) 30x50
Bid Amount Location 11 - (Niobrara - 30604) 30x50	\$42,978.00	No Bid	\$41,600.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Bid Amount Location 11 - (Niobrara - 30604) 30x50
Bid Amount Location 12 - (Sidney - 52109) 30x50	\$51,423.00	No Bid	\$43,200.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Bid Amount Location 12 - (Sidney - 52109) 30x50
Bid Amount Location 13 - (Crawford - 50805) 30x50	\$51,060.00	No Bid	\$43,700.00	\$76,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	Bid Amount Location 13 - (Crawford - 50805) 30x50
Bid Amount Location 14 - (Kimball - 51407) 30x50	\$50,058.00	No Bid	\$43,200.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Bid Amount Location 14 - (Kimball - 51407) 30x50
Bid Amount Location 15 - (Bridgeport - 50215) 30x50	\$49,867.00	No Bid	\$43,200.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Bid Amount Location 15 - (Bridgeport - 50215) 30x50
Bid Amount Location 16 - (Gordon - 50906) 30x50	\$50,305.00	No Bid	\$43,700.00	\$76,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	Bid Amount Location 16 - (Gordon - 50906) 30x50
Bid Amount Location 17 - (Chadron - 52904) 30x50	\$51,060.00	No Bid	\$43,700.00	\$69,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	Bid Amount Location 17 - (Chadron - 52904) 30x50
Bid Amount Location 18 - (Theedford - 62504) 30x50	\$50,489.00	No Bid	\$43,700.00	No Bid	\$180,000.00	No Bid	Bid Amount Location 18 - (Theedford - 62504) 30x50
Bid Amount Location 19 - (Hyannis - 63504) 30x50	\$49,834.00	No Bid	\$43,700.00	\$93,000.00	\$180,000.00	No Bid	Bid Amount Location 19 - (Hyannis - 63504) 30x50
Bid Amount Location 20 - (Broken Bow - 63305) 30x50	\$50,710.00	\$83,400.00	\$43,700.00	No Bid	\$180,000.00	\$42,640.00	Bid Amount Location 20 - (Broken Bow - 63305) 30x50
Bid Amount Location 21 - (Gothenburg - 61307) 30x50	\$49,000.00	\$83,400.00	\$43,200.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$40,003.00	Bid Amount Location 21 - (Gothenburg - 61307) 30x50
Bid Amount Location 22 - (Oconto - 63704) 30x50	\$50,400.00	No Bid	\$43,200.00	No Bid	\$180,000.00	\$41,080.00	Bid Amount Location 22 - (Oconto - 63704) 30x50
Bid Amount Location 23 - (Sutherland - 63602) 30x50	\$48,614.00	No Bid	\$43,200.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$42,120.00	Bid Amount Location 23 - (Sutherland - 63602) 30x50
Bid Amount Location 24 - (Stapleton - 62203) 30x50	\$49,090.00	\$83,400.00	\$43,700.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$42,120.00	Bid Amount Location 24 - (Stapleton - 62203) 30x50
Bid Amount Location 25 - (Benkelman - 70706) 30x50	\$49,466.00	No Bid	\$43,700.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Bid Amount Location 25 - (Benkelman - 70706) 30x50
Bid Amount Location 26 - (Merriman - 80705) 30x50	\$50,946.00	No Bid	\$43,700.00	\$76,000.00	\$180,000.00	No Bid	Bid Amount Location 26 - (Merriman - 80705) 30x50